
September 2019 Obituaries 

Barbara Appleton, 90, died July 13 in Burkburnett, Texas. The Sheppard AFB shift assistant 
retired in 1981. 

George Bagley, 99, died June 16 in Vicenza, Italy. The Vicenza Military Clothing manager retired 
in 1982. 

Ingrid Bowman, 76, died July 12 in Junction City, Kan. The Fort Riley computer operator retired 
in 2011. 

Charles Brooks, 90, died June 4 in Bulverde, Texas. The Davis-Monthan AFB manager retired in 
1984. 

Earl Brooks, 78, died July 21 in Conway, S.C. The Exchange department supervisor retired in 
1993. 

Barrington Brown, 62, died Aug. 8 in Hampton, Va. The Dan Daniel DC equipment mechanic 
foreman retired in 2009. 

Warren Cole, 66, died Aug. 9 in Fayetteville, N.C. He was a food service worker at Fort Bragg. 

Jonathan Coles, 42, died Aug. 3 in Sierra Vista, Ariz. He was a shift manager at Fort Huachuca. 

Katherine Copas, 92, died May 20 in San Antonio, Texas. The JB San Antonio-Lackland 
accounting technician retired in 1992. 

Elizabeth Crosby, 86, died July 1 in Sumter, S.C. The Shaw AFB reorder associate retired in 1992. 

Martha Cuzick, 86, died June 27 in San Antonio, Texas. The JB San Antonio-Fort Sam Houston 
annex operator retired in 1987. 

Helen Daher, 85, died July 20 in Hopkinton, Mass. The Fort Devens supervisory sales associate 
retired in 1981. 

Juan Diniega, 90, died June 21 in San Francisco, Calif. The Andersen AFB associate retired in 
1990. 

James Dougherty, 87, died July 11 in Fayetteville, N.C. The Fort Bragg mobile sales associate 
retired in 1990. 

Elizabeth Dowell, 91, died Jan. 27 in Irvington, Ky. The Fort Knox cook retired in 1989. 

Yvette Evans, 85, died March 8 in Browns Mills, N.J. The JB McGuire-Dix supervisory sales 
assistant retired in 1994. 



Bridgette Fleming, 47, died Aug. 13 in Farmers Branch, Texas. She was a customer relationship 
management associate. 

Daisy Gittings, 89, died July 26 in Aberdeen, Md. The Aberdeen Proving Ground food service 
worker retired in 1990. 

Mildred Holden, 66, died Aug. 3 in Atlanta, Ga. The Atlanta DC warehouse foreman retired in 
2010. 

Karin Hooper, 73, died May 5 in Suffolk, Va. The Aberdeen Proving Ground inventory control 
associate retired in 2011. 

Emily Kawakami, 78, died July 27 in Honolulu, Hawaii. She was a supervisor at the Hawaii DC. 

Thomas Martin, 87, died May 21 in Tacoma, Wash. The Northwest Area general manager 
retired in 1980. 

Edward Martinez, 71, died Aug. 9 in Great Britain. He was a customer experience associate at 
RAF Alconbury. 

Richard Miller, 84, died June 25 in Kechi, Kan. The JB Elmendorf assistant retail manager retired 
in 1993. 

Andy Moore, 90, died July 24 in Gurley, Ala. The Redstone Arsenal courier retired in 1984. 

Arlene Moore, 94, died June 30 in Smiths Station, Ala. The Fort Benning accounting technician 
retired in 1989. 

Anne Murray, 96, died July 12 in Austin, Texas. The HQ equal employment opportunity 
specialist retired in 1988. 

Phoebe Murrell, 79, died April 22 in Sacramento, Calif. The McClellan AFB reorder assistant 
retired in 2004. 

Maria Perez, 80, died May 21 in Fair Oaks, Texas She was a food service worker at JB San 
Antonio-Lackland. 

Aramis Quevedo-Martinez, 82, died July 9 in Germany. The Heidelberg associate retired in 
1996. 

Aubrey Rembold, 82, died Aug. 16 in Little Elm, Texas. The HQ manager retired in 1993. 

Gertrude Talbert, 91, died June 25 in Ozark, Ala. The Fort Rucker senior store associate retired 
in 1990. 

William Wainscott, 81, died Aug. 15 in Great Britain. He was a shift supervisor at RAF Alconbury. 



Mary Webb, 77, died July 24 in Fort Walton Beach, Fla. The NAS Fort Worth JRB store manager 
retired in 1997. 

 

September Transfers 

Brandi Army – sales area manager, JB Elmendorf, to combined activities manager, White Sands 
Missile Range 

Robin Boylan – general manager, Spangdahlem AB, to general manager, Fort Meade 

Connie Brunson – food court manager, Misawa AB, to food court manager, Keesler AFB 

John Cornett – end user computer technician, HQ, to field technical supervisor, Europe 

Jacinta Crim – logistics analyst, HQ, to DC manager I, Germersheim DC 

Christopher Frode-Hansen – food court manager, JB Lewis-McChord, to food court manager, 
Fort Carson 

Angelita Gonzalez – store manager, Travis AFB, to assistant store manager, Kwajalein 

Scott Laschkewitsch – advanced retail manager trainee, HQ, to sales & merchandise manager, 
Fort Gordon 

Krystin Lewis - workforce planning & development manager, HQ, to workforce planning & 
development manager, Nellis AFB 

Lori Maggard – senior restaurant program planner, HQ, to general manager, Spangdahlem AB 

Cleta McCarthy – restaurant manager, Fort Belvoir, to restaurant manager, Fort Drum 

William Miele – shift manager, Thule AB, to shift manager, Luke AFB 

Jerry Myers – financial analyst III, HQ, to financial systems administrator, HQ 

Boris Nasci – store manager, Aviano AB, to general manager, Osan AB 

Michael Newsome – restaurant manager, Fort Stewart, to food court manager, Luke AFB 

Diana Perkins – sales area manager, Luke AFB, to store manager, Schofield Barracks 

Maria Rowan – food court manager, Aviano AB, to food court manager, Grafenwoehr 

Tammy Toney – store manager, JB Langley-Eustis, to general manager, Hanscom AFB 



Michael Tura – assistant store manager, Seymour Johnson AFB, to assistant store  manager, 
Okinawa 

Bobby Upton – assistant store manager, Fort Irwin, to store manager (MCS), Fort Bliss 

Julia Woods – store manager, Hickam AFB, to general manager, Yokota AB 

 

September Retirements 

Daphne Alberty, HQ, 35 years 

Eldon Ashley, Waco DC, 27 years 

Douglas Baker, JB McGuire-Dix, 18 years 

Percy Baroma, JB Andrews, 17 years 

Dwayne Bomer, HQ, 21 years 

Reginald Brockett, JB Andrews, 30 years 

Julia Caldwell, Wright-Patterson AFB, 25 years 

Phillip Capshaw, Hanscom AFB, 32 years 

Sawang Cordle, Fort Lee, 13 years 

Jean Dandridge, Fort Riley, 30 years 

David Evans, Hill AFB, 8 years 

Sona Garabettian, Westover AFB, 35 years 

Danny Gasparek, HQ, 30 years 

Sylvia Griffiths, HQ  , 21 years 

Fumiko Hughes, Camp Zama, 32 years 

Aftab Khan, Grafenwoehr, 22 years 

Amanda Leroy, HQ, 29 years 

Della Lewis, Fort Leavenworth, 19 years 

Dorothea McMillan, Fort Carson, 19 years 



Linda McPherson, Fort Jackson, 16 years 

Marlene Meadows, Fort Bragg, 19 years 

Jerome Melillo, Fort Hood, 31 years 

Jeanette Paez, JB San Antonio-Lackland, 30 years 

Christina Reynolds, Yokota AB, 22 years 

Brent Richardson, HQ, 30 years 

Suzanne Rivetts, Fort McCoy, 6 years 

Alice Rose, Eglin AFB, 24 years 

Robin Ruparchich, Dyess AFB, 22 years 

Shirleen Russell, Southwest Asia, 34 years 

Franklin Sewell, Edwards AFB, 20 years 

Gilbert Sierra, Europe, 18 years 

Keith Simmons, Fort Leavenworth, 13 years 

Sylvia Simpson, HQ, 31 years 

Janet Smiley, Fort Bliss, 23 years 

Cheryl Suganuma, Kirtland AFB, 32 years 

Gloria Toney, Waco DC, 16 years 

Tok Tyler, Fort Lee, 21 years 

Thomas Weber, Fort Sill, 30 years 

Theresa Weir, Beale AFB, 10 years 

Robert Wheeler, UK Consolidated, 15 years 

Catherine Wicker, West Coast DC, 18 years 


